
/WHY IT
MATTERS

We are definitely living in a time of information
overload. It is challenging to stay on top of all that is
happening, while keeping up with our own obligations
and activities. Furthermore, sustainability news tends
to be on the negative side, creating doomsday
scenarios and scary prophecies that can trigger
anxiety, and not precisely inspiring us to act. We may
tend to avoid the news because it makes us feel bad,
sad, or concerned.

Yet we tend to underestimate our own power and
influence in shaping a better world. As a matter of fact,
if the challenges we are currently experiencing are a
product of past problematic behaviors, then we are
also positively shaping the future of the planet with our
current mindful decisions and restorative actions.

That opens up one interesting path. Understanding the
scope of the sustainability challenges, from the
environmental and social perspective, allows us to
start noticing linkages, relationships and connections.

The other powerful path is in our emotions. When we
allow ourselves to connect from the heart with the
reality of the news and find small ways to change our
behavior, we are more present and don’t need to live
with our divided selves. This can be is very fulfilling.

How your group balances the cognitive, behavioral
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